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RESIDENTIAL ENERGY CODE INFORMATION 

AND GUIDANCE FOR PASSING THE BLOWER DOOR TEST 

Significant changes to building energy efficiency requirements were introduced into the 
2015 Michigan Residential Code. The following represents key changes and areas of 
common questions or violations of the 2015 Michigan Residential Code. This is not 
intended to be inclusive but aid to the builder so as to alleviate problems in the field. 
The following guidance is taken from Chapter 11 - ENERGY EFFICIENCY of the 2015 
Michigan Residential Code. 

R 402.4.1.2 (p. 44 7-448) TESTING. The building or dwelling unit shall be tested and 

verified as having an air leakage rate of not exceeding 4 air changes per hour. Testing 
shall be conducted with a blower door ... by a certified independent third party. A 
written report of the results of the test shall be signed by the party conducting the test 
and provided to the code official. 

Passing the blower door test results in a building envelope that is "tight". Benefits often 
will include less dust, bugs and exterior noise entering the dwelling. Proper air 
exchange and indoor air quality is not compromised in a new code built home. Bath 
fans, range hoods, etc. are important features of new homes as are other forms of 
mechanical ventilation that are intentional and controllable. "Seal it tight and ventilated 
right" is a common way of describing energy efficient building shell or building 
envelope construction methods. 

R 402.4 (p. 44 7). AIR LEAKAGE. The thermal building envelope shall be constructed 
to limit air leakage in accordance with the requirements of (the energy code). Sealing 
methods ... shall allow for differential expansion and contraction. 

The purpose of air sealing is to block or stop air leakage and to create an effective air 
barrier. An air barrier is anything that stops air movement through a building assembly 
such as a wall, ceiling, floor etc. Most insulation - except closed cell spray foam - is not 
an air barrier. Insulation needs an air barrier for it to work and achieve the listed R­
value. Insulation is tested in a laboratory within a sealed box with no air leakage. The 
"thermal building envelope" shall be understood as any assembly that includes BOTH 
insulation and an air barrier. 




